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David Ward

From: David Ward <dward@loudounwireless.com>
Sent: Tuesday, October 13, 2015 4:30 PM
To: 'David Nelson'
Cc: 'Bruce Johnson'; 'Patti Psaris'; 'Otto Gutenson'; 'Eleanor M Adams'; 'Anne Larson'; 'Dave 

Ward'
Subject: RE: Catoctin Creek Scenic River Advisory Committee - DRAFT Logo

The cost is $39.95  (I may be able to get a coupon discount….) 

Below is current budget.  No expense have been submitted for reimbursement 
 

Item Description Cost  
Paid via CC (D 

Ward) 
1 Dreamhost domain set-up and first year $    35.40 2/10/2015 
2 Weebly annual fee $  139.00 8/11/2015 
3 Dreamhost annual hosting starting 2016 $  119.40   
4 LogoMix graphic $    39.95   

 
 
From: David Nelson [mailto:danelson2009@gmail.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, October 13, 2015 4:15 PM 
To: David Ward <dward@loudounwireless.com> 
Cc: Bruce Johnson <bruce298@gmail.com>; Patti Psaris <pattipsaris@rstarmail.com>; Otto Gutenson 
<otto100@loudounwireless.com>; Eleanor M Adams <emcgadams@earthlink.net>; Anne Larson 
<annelarson2006@gmail.com>; Dave Ward <catoctinscenicriver@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: Catoctin Creek Scenic River Advisory Committee - DRAFT Logo 
 
 
cost? 
 
On Tue, Oct 13, 2015 at 3:53 PM, David Ward <dward@loudounwireless.com> wrote: 

I took the liberty to create a favicon.ico based on the logo (haven’t made the actual purchase yet) .  It’s a 64x64 
pixel graphic which displays in browser in upper left corner of the below partial screen shot. 
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From: Bruce Johnson [mailto:bruce298@gmail.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, October 13, 2015 3:16 PM 
To: David Nelson <danelson2009@gmail.com> 
Cc: David Ward <dward@loudounwireless.com>; Patti Psaris <pattipsaris@rstarmail.com>; Otto Gutenson 
<otto100@loudounwireless.com>; Eleanor M Adams <emcgadams@earthlink.net>; Anne Larson 
<annelarson2006@gmail.com>; catoctinscenicriver@gmail.com 
Subject: Re: Catoctin Creek Scenic River Advisory Committee - DRAFT Logo 

  

I like it too! Let's use it if all agree. Bruce 
 
Sent from my iPad 

 
On Oct 13, 2015, at 11:09 AM, David Nelson <danelson2009@gmail.com> wrote: 

  

Wow, that's very nice! 

  

Any objections from the team for using this in our web site and other documents? 

  

Sincerely, 

  

  

David Nelson 
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703-989-8072 

 
On Oct 13, 2015, at 10:53 AM, David Ward <dward@loudounwireless.com> wrote: 

What do you think of this DRAFT logo? 

  

I created it using canned graphics from LogoMix.com 

  

The cost is $39.95 

  

<image001.jpg> 

  

  

<Logomix_DRAFT_logo.jpg> 

 
 
 
 
--  
 
Regards, 
 
David Nelson 
703-989-8072 


